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“We forget, living in this era of heavily patented research and closely guarded results, how wonderfully
exciting the scientific world used to be. In Stealing God’s Thunder, the story of Benjamin Franklin’s
invention of the lightening rod and the resulting consequences, that sense of wonder and excitement and even
fear comes beautifully to life. Philip Dray does a remarkable job of illuminating the ever-fascinating Franklin
and, more than that, the way that he, and his invention, helped create the new scientific world.”
–Deborah Blum, author of Love at Goon Park: Harry Harlow and the Science of Affection

Stealing God’s Thunder is a concise, richly detailed biography of Benjamin Franklin viewed through the
lens of his scientific inquiry and its ramifications for American democracy. Today we think of Benjamin
Franklin as a founder of American independence who also dabbled in science. But in Franklin’s day it was
otherwise. Long before he was an eminent statesman, he was famous for his revolutionary scientific work,
especially his experiments with lightning and electricity.

Pulitzer Prize finalist Philip Dray uses the evolution of Franklin’s scientific curiosity and empirical thinking
as a metaphor for America’s struggle to establish its fundamental values. Set against the backdrop of the
Enlightenment and America’s pursuit of political equality for all, Stealing God’s Thunder recounts how
Franklin unlocked one of the greatest natural mysteries of his day, the seemingly unknowable powers of
electricity and lightning. Rich in historic detail and based on numerous primary sources, Stealing God’s
Thunder is a fascinating original look at one of our most beloved and complex founding fathers.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Ramos:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you will have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin Franklin's
Lightning Rod and the Invention of America, you can enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still wish
to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't have it, oh
come on its named reading friends.

Mary Clement:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin Franklin's
Lightning Rod and the Invention of America reserve written by well-known writer whose to say well how to
make book that may be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written within good manner for you,
dripping every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still doubt
Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin Franklin's Lightning Rod and the Invention of America as good book not
merely by the cover but also from the content. This is one e-book that can break don't assess book by its
handle, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense
already told you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Elsie Hawkins:

The book untitled Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin Franklin's Lightning Rod and the Invention of America
contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy method. The language
is very straightforward all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by
famous author. The author will take you in the new time of literary works. It is easy to read this book
because you can read on your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book inside anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site along with order it. Have a
nice go through.

Timothy Pace:

Beside this kind of Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin Franklin's Lightning Rod and the Invention of
America in your phone, it might give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or information. The
information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh from your oven so don't be worry if you feel like
an previous people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Stealing God's Thunder: Benjamin
Franklin's Lightning Rod and the Invention of America because this book offers for your requirements
readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you rarely get what it's exactly about. Oh come on,
that would not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be



questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss it? Find this book in addition to
read it from at this point!
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