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An authoritative survey of the masters of twentieth-century modernist architecture in Los Angeles. This
revisionist study explores the history of modernist architecture in Greater Los Angeles from the early
twentieth century to the 1970s, focusing on both its regional and international contexts. Thomas Hines
critically analyzes the concepts of modernism and regionalism and begins his exploration by contrasting the
turn-of-the-century Craftsman work of Charles and Henry Greene with the rationalist modernism of their
contemporary Irving Gill and the expressionist modernism of Frank Lloyd Wright and his son Lloyd Wright.
The book re-interprets the modernist variations of Wright’s disciple Rudolph Schindler and the International
Style of his contemporary Richard Neutra, as well as of their followers: Gregory Ain, Raphael Soriano, and
Harwell Harris. The minimalist Case Study House program is contrasted with the sensuous modernism of
John Lautner and with the large-scale modernism of William Pereira and Welton Becket. Hines ends the
book in the early 1970s, as modernism began to confront the challenge of the post-modernist critique. A
personal epilogue reflects on the author’s exploration of Los Angeles modernism from the late 1960s to
2009.
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From reader reviews:

Cinthia Beltran:

Here thing why this specific Architecture of the Sun: Los Angeles Modernism 1900-1970 are different and
trustworthy to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content than it
which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Architecture of the Sun: Los Angeles Modernism 1900-
1970 giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no
guide that similar with Architecture of the Sun: Los Angeles Modernism 1900-1970. It gives you thrill
examining journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is probably
can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your
means home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of
Architecture of the Sun: Los Angeles Modernism 1900-1970 in e-book can be your choice.

Lynnette Cash:

This Architecture of the Sun: Los Angeles Modernism 1900-1970 is great publication for you because the
content which can be full of information for you who else always deal with world and have to make decision
every minute. This book reveal it information accurately using great manage word or we can state no
rambling sentences inside. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it
only provides straight forward sentences but challenging core information with wonderful delivering
sentences. Having Architecture of the Sun: Los Angeles Modernism 1900-1970 in your hand like having the
world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no publication that offer you world
throughout ten or fifteen second right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hi
Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt which?

Ella Oxley:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside using friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It fine you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Architecture of the
Sun: Los Angeles Modernism 1900-1970 which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this
book? Let's view.

Maria Clyburn:

You will get this Architecture of the Sun: Los Angeles Modernism 1900-1970 by go to the bookstore or
Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties to your knowledge.
Kinds of this book are various. Not only simply by written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book
by e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their
problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most



important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose right ways
for you.
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