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Celebrated author Laurie R. King dazzles mystery lovers once again in To Play the Fool, her second Kate
Martinelli mystery.

The story unfolds as a band of homeless people cremate a beloved dog in San Francisco's Golden Gate Park.
When it comes to incidents like this, the authorities are willing to overlook a few broken regulations. But
three weeks later, after the dog's owner gets the same fiery send-off, the SFPD knows it has a serious
problem on its hands.

Other than the fact that they're dealing with a particularly grisly homicide, Inspector Kate Martinelli and her
partner, Al Hawkin, have little else to go on. They have a homeless victim without a positive ID, a group of
witnesses who have little love for the cops, and a possible suspect, known only as Brother Erasmus.

Kate learns that Erasmus is well-acquainted with the park's homeless and with the rarefied atmosphere of
Berkeley's Graduate Theological Union, yet he remains an enigma to all. It's apparent that he is by no means
crazy--but he is a fool. Kate begins the frustrating task of interrogating a man who communicates only
through quotations. Trying to learn something of his history leads her along a twisting road to a disbanded
cult, long-buried secrets, the thirst for spirituality, and the hunger for bloody vengeance.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Taylor:

Inside other case, little individuals like to read book To Play the Fool: A Novel (A Kate Martinelli Mystery
Book 2). You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Providing we know about how is
important some sort of book To Play the Fool: A Novel (A Kate Martinelli Mystery Book 2). You can add
knowledge and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from
book you can understand everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you will end up
known. About simple issue until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we are able to open a
book or perhaps searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored stiff
to go to the library. Let's go through.

Angela Dickens:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what you problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or woman? If
you don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And
you have free time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They must answer that
question because just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it
is correct. Because start from on pre-school until university need this To Play the Fool: A Novel (A Kate
Martinelli Mystery Book 2) to read.

Judith Bode:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind ability
or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to can satisfy your
short period of time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book that need more time to be go
through. To Play the Fool: A Novel (A Kate Martinelli Mystery Book 2) can be your answer mainly because
it can be read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

Miguel Sherman:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt it when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book To Play the Fool: A Novel (A Kate
Martinelli Mystery Book 2) to make your personal reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading
talent is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to read it and
mingle the impression about book and reading especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open a
book and read it. Beside that the book To Play the Fool: A Novel (A Kate Martinelli Mystery Book 2) can to
be your brand new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing
of that time.
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