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Offering rare insiders’ perspectives, Trends in Corrections: Interviews with Corrections Leaders
Around the World is a comprehensive survey of correctional programming and management styles used
across nations. Twelve chapters present transcribed interviews of corrections leaders along with a brief
portrait of the corrections system in those jurisdictions. The leaders interviewed represent a variety of
cultures, political environments, and economic systems and come from North America (Canada, Mexico, and
the United States), Asia (Singapore), Australia, the Caribbean (Trinidad and Tobago), and Europe (England,
Hungary, and Bosnia–Herzegovina).

Topics discussed in this insightful collection of interviews include:

Working conditions for correction officers●

How governmental changes can impact a prison system●

Overcrowding problems and efforts to modernize prisons●

Recidivism concerns and programs that facilitate offender reintegration into society upon release●

Effects of the media’s portrayal of prisons on communities●

The final chapter reflects on the interviews and summarizes the common themes evident throughout the
book. Advancing knowledge about corrections systems worldwide, this volume bridges the gap of
knowledge that exists between scholars and researchers in academia and practitioners in the field. The candid
discussions presented herein are destined to open further dialogue among these professionals, adding value to
current operations and informing future directions.
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From reader reviews:

Christine Hughes:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book Trends in Corrections: Interviews with Corrections Leaders
Around the World (Interviews with Global Leaders in Policing, Courts, and Prisons). You can choose the
best book if you love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important any book Trends in
Corrections: Interviews with Corrections Leaders Around the World (Interviews with Global Leaders in
Policing, Courts, and Prisons). You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by just a
book. Absolutely right, because from book you can understand everything! From your country until foreign
or abroad you can be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we
can open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel
weary to go to the library. Let's read.

Jonathan Solis:

Book is actually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
e-book. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication Trends in Corrections:
Interviews with Corrections Leaders Around the World (Interviews with Global Leaders in Policing, Courts,
and Prisons) will make you to be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every
little thing. But some of you think that will open or reading a new book make you bored. It's not make you
fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

Christy Fowler:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't evaluate book by its deal with may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside search likes. Maybe you answer is usually Trends in Corrections: Interviews with Corrections
Leaders Around the World (Interviews with Global Leaders in Policing, Courts, and Prisons) why because
the great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside
or content is fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions
to pick up this book.

Don Morris:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison with
can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be read.
Trends in Corrections: Interviews with Corrections Leaders Around the World (Interviews with Global
Leaders in Policing, Courts, and Prisons) can be your answer mainly because it can be read by a person who



have those short free time problems.
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