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An enchanting and staggeringly original debut novel about one day in the lives of three unforgettable
characters
 
Madeleine Altimari is a smart-mouthed, rebellious nine-year-old who also happens to be an aspiring jazz
singer. Still mourning the recent death of her mother, and caring for her grief-stricken father, she doesn’t
realize that on the eve of Christmas Eve she is about to have the most extraordinary day—and night—of her
life. After bravely facing down mean-spirited classmates and rejection at school, Madeleine doggedly
searches for Philadelphia's legendary jazz club The Cat's Pajamas, where she’s determined to make her on-
stage debut. On the same day, her fifth grade teacher Sarina Greene, who’s just moved back to Philly after a
divorce, is nervously looking forward to a dinner party that will reunite her with an old high school crush,
afraid to hope that sparks might fly again. And across town at The Cat's Pajamas, club owner Lorca
discovers that his beloved haunt may have to close forever, unless someone can find a way to quickly raise
the $30,000 that would save it.
 
As these three lost souls search for love, music and hope on the snow-covered streets of Philadelphia,
together they will discover life’s endless possibilities over the course of one magical night. A vivacious,
charming and moving debut, 2 A.M. at The Cat's Pajamas will capture your heart and have you laughing out
loud.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Aline Moran:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action,
like looking for your favorite guide and reading a book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled 2 A.M. at The Cat's Pajamas. Try to the actual book 2 A.M. at The
Cat's Pajamas as your friend. It means that it can being your friend when you sense alone and beside that of
course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you much
more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let us make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Henry Evans:

The book 2 A.M. at The Cat's Pajamas gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You need to
use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you
getting strain or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make reading a book 2 A.M. at The
Cat's Pajamas to be your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your capable, increase
your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You could know everything if you like open and read a
publication 2 A.M. at The Cat's Pajamas. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science guide or
encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Edna McArdle:

The ability that you get from 2 A.M. at The Cat's Pajamas is a more deep you searching the information that
hide in the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to know but
2 A.M. at The Cat's Pajamas giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in
selected way that can be understood by anyone who read that because the author of this guide is well-known
enough. That book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then
can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this particular 2
A.M. at The Cat's Pajamas instantly.

Dorothy Cropper:

Reading a book being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you learn a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and soon. The 2 A.M. at The Cat's
Pajamas provide you with new experience in reading a book.
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