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What can schools do to raise the academic attainment of every pupil?

Helping you to ensure that every pupil fulfils their potential, this book draws on the authors' research and
practical experience to demonstrate what can be done to raise attainment, especially in pupils from culturally
diverse backgrounds.

This book contains tried-and-tested strategies for:

- inducting asylum seekers

- supporting bilingual learners

- working with gypsy and traveller children

- raising the attainment of black boys

- working with parents and the local community

Highly practical, this book contains lesson activities, suggestions for improving your teaching skills, case
studies and activities for professional reflection.



All teachers, teaching assistants and teacher trainers, especially those working in culturally diverse
classrooms, will want to read this book.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Brooks:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-book
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they consider because their hobby is actually reading a book. Why not the person who
don't like reading through a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem
or exercise. Well, probably you will want this Aiming High: Raising Attainment of Pupils from Culturally-
Diverse Backgrounds.

Carl Vincent:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give
you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of guide you read,
if you want drive more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really feel happy read one
along with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The Aiming High: Raising Attainment of
Pupils from Culturally-Diverse Backgrounds is kind of guide which is giving the reader unforeseen
experience.

Linda Doyle:

The book Aiming High: Raising Attainment of Pupils from Culturally-Diverse Backgrounds has a lot of
information on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by the very
famous author. Mcdougal makes some research just before write this book. This specific book very easy to
read you may get the point easily after perusing this book.

Dennis Green:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not attempting Aiming High: Raising
Attainment of Pupils from Culturally-Diverse Backgrounds that give your satisfaction preference will be
satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the means for people to
know world better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be claimed constantly that
reading routine only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for all of
you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you could pick Aiming High: Raising Attainment of
Pupils from Culturally-Diverse Backgrounds become your own personal starter.
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