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One of the primary functions of law is to ensure that the legal structure governing all social relations is
predictable, coherent, consistent and applicable. Taken together, these characteristics of law are referred to as
legal certainty. In traditional approaches to legal certainty, law is regarded as a hierarchical system of rules
characterized by stability, clarity, uniformity, calculable enforcement, publicity and predictability. However,
the current reality is that national legal systems no longer operate in isolation, but within a multilevel legal
order, wherein norms created at both the international and regional level are directly applicable to national
legal systems. Also, norm creation is no longer the exclusive prerogative of public officials of the state:
private actors have an increasing influence on norm creation as well. Social scientists have referred to this
phenomenon of interacting and overlapping competences as multilevel governance. Only recently have legal
scholars focused attention on the increasing interconnectedness (and therefore the concomitant loss of
primacy of national legal orders) between the global, European and national regulatory spheres through the
concept of multilevel regulation.

In this project the author uses multilevel regulation as a term to characterize a regulatory space in which the
process of rule making, rule enforcement and rule adjudication (the regulatory lifecycle) is dispersed across
more than one administrative or territorial level and amongst several different actors, both public and private.
The author draws on the concept of a regulatory space, using it as a framing device to differentiate between
specific aspects of policy fields. The relationship between actors in such a space is non-hierarchical and they
may be independent of each other. The lack of central ordering of the regulatory lifecycle within this
regulatory space is the most important feature of such a space. The implications of multilevel regulation for
the notion of legal certainty have attracted limited attention from scholars and the demand for legal certainty
in regulatory practice is still a puzzle. The book explores the idea of legal certainty in terms of the
perceptions and expectations of regulatees in the context of medical products – specifically, pharmaceuticals
and medical devices, which can be differentiated as two regulatory spaces and therefore form two case
studies. As an exploratory project, the book necessarily explores new territory in terms of investigating legal
certainty first in terms of regulatee perceptions and expectations and second, because it studies it in the
context of multilevel regulation.
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From reader reviews:

Audrey Thompson:

This European Regulation of Medical Devices and Pharmaceuticals: Regulatee Expectations of Legal
Certainty book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by
reading this book is definitely information inside this guide incredible fresh, you will get data which is
getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This European Regulation of Medical Devices and
Pharmaceuticals: Regulatee Expectations of Legal Certainty without we realize teach the one who examining
it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't end up being worry European Regulation of
Medical Devices and Pharmaceuticals: Regulatee Expectations of Legal Certainty can bring any time you are
and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it with your lovely
laptop even mobile phone. This European Regulation of Medical Devices and Pharmaceuticals: Regulatee
Expectations of Legal Certainty having fine arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not feel
uninterested in reading.

Debra Davis:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different you can
read a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the
whole day to reading a book. The book European Regulation of Medical Devices and Pharmaceuticals:
Regulatee Expectations of Legal Certainty it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of those who
recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to
bring this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from your smart
phone. The price is not too expensive but this book offers high quality.

Martina White:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try and and must have the extra time or they will get lot of
stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not only a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity are there
when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you ever
try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the actual
book you have read is European Regulation of Medical Devices and Pharmaceuticals: Regulatee
Expectations of Legal Certainty.

Cheryl Ruiz:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many question for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading.



Some people likes reading through, not only science book but additionally novel and European Regulation of
Medical Devices and Pharmaceuticals: Regulatee Expectations of Legal Certainty or maybe others sources
were given know-how for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel desire to read more and
more. Science e-book was created for teacher or even students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to
increase their knowledge. In different case, beside science publication, any other book likes European
Regulation of Medical Devices and Pharmaceuticals: Regulatee Expectations of Legal Certainty to make
your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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