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Emily Nevins has built a web of lies to protect her family's inheritance. To save it all, she consorts with
pirates to smuggle brandy. On the run from British troops, American Revolutionary War spy Ryan Sutton
will do anything for his cause, even blackmail a woman with as many secrets as he has. Ryan is drawn to
Emily’s beauty and fire, but he’ll risk his very life if gives in to their forbidden attraction.

England, 1779. Emily Nevins has built a web of lies to protect her family's inheritance. In order to save it all,
she consorts with pirates to smuggle brandy. But when a devastatingly handsome stranger bursts into her
home threatening to expose her, she has no choice but to give into his demands––and maybe a few kisses.

On the run from British troops, American Revolutionary War spy Ryan Sutton will do anything for his cause,
even blackmail a woman with as many secrets as he has. Ryan is drawn to Emily’s beauty and fire. He meant
never to see her again, for her safety and his, but a chance encounter pulls him once more into Emily's
dangerous circle.

She can't depend on a traitorous spy who could expose her. And Ryan risks his very life if he gives in to their
forbidden attraction.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Jones:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book
which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of e-book you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want experience
happy read one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the Sweet Treason is kind
of e-book which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Donald Cortes:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in comparison with
can satisfy your short time to read it because all of this time you only find publication that need more time to
be go through. Sweet Treason can be your answer since it can be read by anyone who have those short spare
time problems.

Donald Worsley:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
think reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Sweet Treason which is keeping
the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Patrick Reyes:

Within this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time not much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many
books in the top checklist in your reading list is usually Sweet Treason. This book and that is qualified as
The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking up and review this
book you can get many advantages.
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