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Few books or pamphlets have had as much influence on the course of human history as Thomas Paine's
Common Sense. The Declaration of Independence severed political bonds with England, but it was Paine's
dynamic pamphlet that conceptualized the idea of unity and freedom months before Thomas Jefferson put
pen to parchment. Paine's publication energized a vast number of colonists to embark on a long and bloody
war that imperiled their livelihoods and dismantled their cultural identity-all in the hope of creating a new
nation constructed upon the concepts of liberty and independence.

Although many people know of Tom Paine and his famous Common Sense, the historic pamphlet has not
been readily accessible or widely read. But it needs to be, because it is one of our nation's most important
founding documents.

Fifth-grade history teacher Mark Wilensky rectifies this oversight with the publication of The Elementary
Common Sense of Thomas Paine: An Interactive Adaptation for All Ages. This remarkable interactive
version is adapted for young and old alike, and makes Paine's words and the concepts he espoused widely
available to everyone.

Wilensky's interactive Common Sense offers a rich array of colonial history sprinkled with audio, video, and
text graphics linked to a dynamic online website. This adaptation includes the original Common Sense, a
new adapted version in plain language everyone can understand today, an extensive chronology of important
pre-revolutionary events leading up to the publication of Paine's pamphlet, and adapted versions of the Olive
Branch Petition, A Proclamation For Suppressing Rebellion And Sedition, and the Boston Port Act.
Wilensky also includes a wide variety of insights on colonial coins and mercantilism, and many humorous
illustrations designed to convey the important concepts of independence and liberty.

Instructors and parents will especially appreciate Wilensky's decision to include supplementary materials
such as teaching plans for classroom and home schooling use. These include a wide variety of activities to
engage students, all based on National Curriculum Standards.

Colonial America was a continent with multiple cultures and customs spanning vast geographic distances.
Tom Paine's amazing persuasive essay Common Sense unified these seemingly conflicting characteristics
into the most remarkable nation ever founded in the history of mankind. The Elementary Common Sense of
Thomas Paine will reignite the ardor of our Founding Fathers for a new generation.

REVIEWS

". . . a wonderfully useful modern-day adaptation for classroom educators." - HistoryTeacher.org (Society for
History Education)



"Wilensky, a fifth grade teacher, really knows his stuff. He makes material that is as dry as bone fun to read,
and the information on the Web site adds extra depth. . . . anyone teaching American History, either in a
classroom or as a home-schooling parent, will want this book on hand." - Voice of Youth Advocates
(VOYA)

"The pamphlet that inspired a revolution. "The Elementary Common Sense of Thomas Paine" deeply
explores the historic work of Thomas Paine and elaborates on its importance for younger readers. Chapters
outline the history surrounding the pre-publication and post-publication of the work. With illustrations to
make Paine's points clear to young people, "The Elementary Common Sense of Thomas Paine" is a fine
introduction to Paine's legendary pamphlet, and highly recommended." - Midwest Book Review

"This book has the potential to encourage youth to become fiercely American in a way similar to that of the
revolutionaries who founded this great country. This adaptation is a most readable text." - Eclectic
Homeschool Association
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From reader reviews:

Steven Bemis:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider if those information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now could be taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you get it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take THE ELEMENTARY COMMON SENSE OF THOMAS
PAINE: An Interactive Adaptation for All Ages as your daily resource information.

John Ma:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, short story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting THE ELEMENTARY
COMMON SENSE OF THOMAS PAINE: An Interactive Adaptation for All Ages that give your enjoyment
preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as
the method for people to know world better then how they react toward the world. It can't be stated
constantly that reading routine only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to always be success
person. So , for every you who want to start studying as your good habit, you are able to pick THE
ELEMENTARY COMMON SENSE OF THOMAS PAINE: An Interactive Adaptation for All Ages become
your own starter.

Virgie Haynes:

This THE ELEMENTARY COMMON SENSE OF THOMAS PAINE: An Interactive Adaptation for All
Ages is brand new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information mainly because it
relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know or else you
who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this THE ELEMENTARY COMMON SENSE OF
THOMAS PAINE: An Interactive Adaptation for All Ages can be the light food for you personally because
the information inside this book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books produce itself in the form that
is certainly reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in
reserve form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So you cannot find any in
reading a book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you. So ,
don't miss that! Just read this e-book sort for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Santiago Johnson:

You can find this THE ELEMENTARY COMMON SENSE OF THOMAS PAINE: An Interactive
Adaptation for All Ages by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it can to be
your solve challenge if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only by



simply written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era just like
now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose
your personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to
make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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