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From the outset of Napoleon’s career, the charismatic Corsican was compared to mythic heroes of antiquity
like Achilles, and even today he remains the apotheosis of French glory, a value deeply embedded in the
country’s history. From this angle, the Napoleonic era can be viewed as the final chapter in the battle of the
Ancients and Moderns. In this book, Robert Morrissey presents a literary and cultural history of glory and its
development in France and explores the “economy of glory” Napoleon sought to implement in an attempt to
heal the divide between the Old Regime and the Revolution.
 

Examining how Napoleon saw glory as a means of escaping the impasse of Revolutionary ideas of radical
egalitarianism, Morrissey illustrates the challenge the leader faced in reconciling the antagonistic values of
virtue and self-interest, heroism and equality. He reveals that the economy of glory was both egalitarian,
creating the possibility of an aristocracy based on merit rather than wealth, and traditional, being deeply
embedded in the history of aristocratic chivalry and the monarchy—making it the heart of Napoleon’s
politics of fusion. Going beyond Napoleon, Morrissey considers how figures of French romanticism such as
Chateaubriand, Balzac, and Hugo constantly reevaluated this legacy of glory and its consequences for
modernity. Available for the first time in English, The Economy of Glory is a sophisticated and beautifully
written addition to French history.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Dalessio:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even knowledge to
make these people keep up with the era which is always change and progress. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This The Economy of Glory: From
Ancien Régime France to the Fall of Napoleon is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the
world. Why, because book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Christina Bishop:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic
within the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to
fill your current free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book may be option to fill your totally free time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to
try out look for book, may be the e-book untitled The Economy of Glory: From Ancien Régime France to the
Fall of Napoleon can be very good book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Lynne Young:

The book untitled The Economy of Glory: From Ancien Régime France to the Fall of Napoleon contain a lot
of information on it. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy way. The language is very
straightforward all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was compiled
by famous author. The author gives you in the new time of literary works. It is possible to read this book
because you can read on your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book inside anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice
examine.

Ronald Cleary:

This The Economy of Glory: From Ancien Régime France to the Fall of Napoleon is brand-new way for you
who has curiosity to look for some information mainly because it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper
you into it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having tiny amount of digest in
reading this The Economy of Glory: From Ancien Régime France to the Fall of Napoleon can be the light
food for you personally because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by simply anyone.
These books produce itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book type.
People who think that in reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy this publication is the answer. So
there is no in reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for
you actually. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book type for your better life and knowledge.
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